
ORDINANCE NO. 12 

Series 2020 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 1 OF TITLE 8 OF THE BRECKENRIDGE TOWN 
CODE BY AMENDING THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2018 EDITION, AND 

THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, 2018 EDITION 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF BRECKENRIDGE, 
COLORADO: 

Section 1. Amend Section 8-1-5 of the Breckenridge Town Code, concerning the 
amendments to the International Residential Code, by adding the following provisions after item 
number 42, and renumbering all following subsections of Section 8-1-5: 

43. Section N1101 .4 Above code programs is amended by adding a new subsection 
N1101 .4.1 Summit Sustainable Building Code to read as follows: 

N1101.4 Summit Sustainable Building Code (SSBC). All new structures defined as 
a residential building under Section N1101.6 of this chapter shall be designed and 
comply with the Department of Energy's Zero Energy Ready Home National 

Program. 

Exception: All new residential structures defined per section N1101 .4.1 shall register 
and submit to be reviewed and inspected through the Department of Energy's Zero 
Energy Ready Home National Program as a training exercise per the Town of 
Breckenridge Building Department. The training exercise program will be effective July 
1, 2020 through December 31, 2020. Full compliance with the Department of 
Energy's Zero Energy Ready Home National Program shall be effective January 1, 
2021. 

44. Table N1102.1.2 (IECC R402.1.2) Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by 
Component is amended by adding footnotes j and k to read as follows: 

Footnote j. For alterations, additions, and remodels of 1,500 square feet or less in size, 
R23 blown in bibs are permitted to be installed in walls in lieu of the R20+5 for additions 
and remodels. If utilizing R23 blown in bibs, the roof/ceiling insulation reductions 
detailed in N1102.2.1 and N1102.2.2.2 are not allowed. 

Footnote k. A fenestration U-Factor of 0.32 is permitted for window replacements for 
Climate Zones 7 and 8. 

45. Section N1104 Electrical Power and Lighting Systems is amended by adding subsection 
N 1104.2, Electric Vehicle (EV) charging for new construction to read as follows: 

N1104.2 Electric Vehicle (EV) charging for new construction. New construction shall 
facilitate future installation and use of Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment (EVSE) in 

accordance with the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70). 

N1104.2.1 One and two family dwellings and townhouses. For each dwelling unit, 
at least one EV Ready Space shall be provided. The branch circuit or raceway shall be 
identified as "EV Ready" in the service panel or subpanel directory and the termination 
shall be marked as "EV Ready". The rough and final inspection shall include a blanked 
electrical box and a raceway terminating in the electrical panel. 

46. Section N1107.1 (R501.1) Scope is amended by adding subsection N1107.1.1, 
Additions and alterations to read as follows: 

N1107.1.1 (R501.1.2) Additions and alterations. Additions and interior alterations to 
an existing building where the total valuation is $50,000 or greater, an energy audit shall 
be provided for the existing structure prior to permit issuance. The energy audit 
recommendations and/or conclusions shall not affect the scope of the work submitted for 
the permit. 

Exceptions: Re-roofs, exterior siding repair or replacement, and deck additions, 
repairs, or alterations shall not require an energy audit to be conducted. 

Page 1 



Section 2. Amend Section 8-1-9 of the Breckenridge Town Code, concerning 
amendments to the International Energy Conservation Code, by adding the following new 
provisions: 

2. Section C101 Scope and General Requirements is amended by adding a new section 
C101.6 Summit Sustainable Building Code (SSBC). 

C101.6 Summit Sustainable Building Code. (SSBC) In addition to the requirements of 
Section C101.5, new buildings shall comply with the Summit Sustainable Building Code, 
in accordance with Sections C101.6.1 and C101.6.2. 

C101.6.1 Residential SSBC. All new residential structures in groups R-2, R-3, and R-4 
occupancies above 3 stories but not more than 5 stories shall be in compliance with the 
Department of Energy's Zero Energy Ready Home National Program. 

Exception: All new residential structures defined per section C101.6.1 shall register and 
submit to be reviewed and inspected through the Department of Energy's Zero Energy 
Ready Home National Program as a training exercise per the Town of Breckenridge 
Building Department. The training program will be effective July 1, 2020 through 
December 31, 2020. Full compliance with the Department of Energy's Zero Energy 
Ready Home National Program shall be effective January 1, 2021. 

C101.6.2 Commercial SSBC. All new structures defined as a Commercial Building in 
Chapter 2 except structures defined under C101.6.1 of this code shall comply with 
amended Sections C401.2, C404.11, and C405.10. 

3. Section 202 Definitions is amended by adding the following definitions within the 
alphabetical order of the existing definitions: 

Electric Vehicle (EV). A vehicle registered for on-road use, primarily powered by an 
electric motor that draws current from a rechargeable storage source that is charged by 
being plugged into an electrical current source. 

Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment (EVSE). The electrical conductors and associated 
equipment external to the electric vehicle that provide a connection between the 
premises wiring and the electric vehicle to provide electric vehicle charging. 

Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment (EVSE) Installed Space. A parking space with electric 
vehicle supply equipment capable of supplying a 40-ampere dedicated branch circuit 
rated at 208/240 volt from a building panel board. 

EV Capable Space. A designated parking space which is provided with a listed raceway 
capable of accommodating a 40-ampere minimum 208/240 volt dedicated branch circuit 
for each future EV Ready or EVSE Installed parking space. Raceways shall not be less 
than trade size 1 (nominal 1-inch inside diameter). Raceways shall originate at the main 
service or subpanel and shall terminate into a listed cabinet, box, or, enclosure in close 
proximity to the proposed location of the EV Capable parking spaces. Raceways are 
required to be continuous at enclosed, inaccessible or concealed areas and spaces. The 
service panel and/or subpanel shall provide capacity to install a 40-ampere minimum 
208/240 volt dedicated branch circuit and space(s) reserved to permit installation of a 
branch circuit overprotection device. 

EV Ready Space. A designated parking space which is provided with minimum one 40-
ampere minimum 208/240 volt dedicated branch circuit for EVSE servicing electric 
vehicles. The circuit shall terminate in a suitable termination point such as a receptacle, 
junction box, or an EVSE, and be located in close proximity to the proposed location of 
the EV Ready parking spaces. 

4. Section C401.2 Application is amended to read as follows: 
C401.2 Application. Commercial buildings shall comply with one of the following: 

1. The requirements of ANSI/ASHRAE/IESNA 90.1. The building's annual 
energy cost shall achieve savings of 25 percent or greater than the baseline 
building energy model developed using ASHRAE 90.1 Energy Cost Budget 
protocol. 

Page2 



2. The requirements of Sections C402 through C405 and C408. In addition, 
commercial buildings shall comply with amended Section C406 and tenant 
spaces shall comply with Section C406.1.1. 

3. The requirements of Sections C402.5, C403.2, C403.3 through C403.3.2, 
C403.4 through C403.4.2.3, C403.10.1 through C403.10.3, C403.11, C403.12, 
C404, C405, C407, and C408. The building energy cost shall be equal to or less 
than 75 percent of the standard reference design building. 

5. Section C404 Service Water Heating is amended by adding a new Section 404.11 
Building Water Use Reduction. 

C404.11 Building Water Use Reduction. All commercial buildings shall comply with the 
requirements as set forth in Section C404.11 and as shown in Table C404.11.1. 

Exception: All structures complying with the Department of Energy's Zero Energy Ready 
Home National Program do not have to comply with Section C404.11. 

TABLE C404.11.1 
PLUMBING FIXTURES AND FITTINGS REQUIREMENTS 

PLUMBING FIXTURE MAXIMUM 
Water Closets (toilets) - flushometer single- Single-flush volume of 1.28 gal (4.8 L) 
flush valve t e 
Water Closets (toilets) - flushometer dual-flush Full-flush volume of 1.28 gal (4.8 L) 
valve t e 

Water Closets toilets - dual-flush tank-t e 
Urinals 

Public meterin self-closin faucet 
Residential bathroom lavator sink faucets Flow rate - 1.5 
Residential kitchen faucets Flow rate - 1.8 

Residential shower compartment (stall) in Flow rate from all shower outlets total of 2.0 
dwellin units and uest rooms m 7.6 Umin 211 elk 

a. With provision for a temporary override to 2.2 gpm (8.3 Umin) as specified in Section 
404.11.1(g) 

C404.11.1 Plumbing Fixtures and Fittings. Plumbing fixtures (water closets and urinals) 
and fittings (faucets and showerheads) shall comply with the following requirements as 
shown in Table C404.11.1. 

A. Water Closets (toilets) - flushometer valve type. For single-flush, maximum 
flush volume shall be determined in accordance with ASME A 112.19.2/CSA 
B45.1 and shall not exceed 1.28 gal (4.8 L) per flush. For dual-flush, the full 
flush volume shall not exceed 1.28 gal (4.8L) per flush. Dual -flush fixtures shall 
also comply with the provisions of ASME A 112.19.14. 

B. Water Closets (toilets) - tank-type. Tank-type water closets shall be certified 
to the performance criteria of the USEPA WaterSense Tank-Type High-Efficiency 
Toilet Specification and shall have a maximum full-flush volume of 1.28 gal (4.8L) 
per flush. Dual-flush fixtures shall also comply with the provisions of ASME 
A112.19.14. 

C. Urinals. Maximum flush volume, when determined in accordance with ASME 
A 112.19.2/CBA B45.1, shall not exceed 0.5 gal (1.9L) per flush. Flushing urinals 
shall comply with the performance criteria of the US EPA WaterSense 
Specification for Flushing Urinals. Non-water urinals shall comply with ASME 
A 112.19.19 (vitreous china) or IAPMO Z124.9 (plastic) as appropriate. 

D. Public Lavatory Faucets. Maximum flow rate shall not exceed 0.5 gpm 
(1.9Umin) when tested in accordance with ASME A 112.18.1/CSA B 125.1. 

E. Public Metering Self-Closing Faucet. Maximum water use shall not exceed 
0.25 gal (1.0 L) per metering cycle when tested in accordance with ASME 
A112.18.1/CSA B125.1. 

Page 3 



F. Residential Bathroom Lavatory Sink Faucets. Maximum flow rate shall not 
exceed 1.5 gpm (5.7 L) when tested in accordance with ASME A112.18.1/CSA 
B125.1. Residential WaterSense High-Efficiency Lavatory Faucet Specifications. 

G. Residential Kitchen Faucets. Maximum flow rate shall not exceed 1.8 gpm 
(6.8 Umin) when tested in accordance with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1. 
Kitchen faucets shall be permitted to temporarily increase the flow greater than 
1.8 gpm (6.8 Umin) but shall not exceed 2.2 gpm (8.3 Umin) and must 
automatically revert to the established maximum flow rate of 1.8 gpm (6.8 Umin) 
upon physical release of the activation mechanism or closure of the faucet valve. 

H. Residential Showerheads. Maximum flow rate shall not exceed 2.0 gpm (7.6 
Umin) when tested in accordance with ASME A 112.18.1/CSA B125.1. 
Residential showerheads shall comply with the performance requirements of the 
USEPA WaterSense Specifications for Showerheads. 

I. Residential Shower Compartment (stall) in Dwelling Units and Guest Rooms. 
The allowable flow rate from all shower outlets (including rain systems, 
waterfalls, body sprays, and jets) that can operate simultaneously shall be limited 
to a total of 2.0 gpm (7.6 Umin). 

Exception: Where the area of a shower compartment exceeds 2600 inch2 (1.7 
m2

), an additional flow of 2.0 gpm (7.6 Umin) shall be permitted for each multiple 
of 2600 inch2 (1. 7 m2

) of floor area or fraction thereof. 

J. Water Bottle Filling Stations. Water bottle filling stations shall be an integral 
part of, or shall be installed adjacent to, not less than 50% of all drinking 
fountains installed indoors on the premises. 

C404.11.2 Appliances. Commercial appliances shall comply with the following 
requirements: 

A Clothes Washers and Dishwashers installed within dwelling units shall comply 
with the ENERGY STAR program requirements for Clothes Washers and 
ENERGY STAR Program requirements for Dishwashers. Maximum water use 
shall be as follows: 

1. Clothes Washers - Maximum water factor (WF) of 5.4 gal/ft3 of drum 
capacity (0.7 LIL of drum capacity) 

2. Dishwashers - Standard size dishwashers shall have a maximum WF 
3.8 gal/full operating cycle (14.3 L/full operating cycle). Compact sizes 
shall have a maximum WF of 3.5 gal/full operating cycle (13.2 L/full 
operating cycle). Standard and compact size shall be defined by 
ENERGY STAR criteria. 

B. Clothes washers installed in publicly accessible spaces (multifamily and 
hotel common areas), and coin/card operated clothes washers of any size 

used in laundromats, shall have a maximum WF of 4.0 gal/ft3 of 
drum capacity during normal cycle (.053 LIL of drum capacity 
during normal cycle). 

C. Commercial dishwashers in commercial food service facilities shall meet all 
ENERGY STAR requirements as listed in the ENERGY STAR Program 
requirements for Commercial Dishwashers, Version 2.0. 

C404.11.3 Commercial Food Service Operations. Commercial food service operations 
(restaurants, cafeterias, food preparation kitchens, caterers, etc.) shall comply with the 
following requirements: 

A. Shall use high-efficiency pre rinse spray valves (I.e. valves that function at 1.3 
gpm (4.9 Umin) or less and comply with a 26 second performance requirement 
when tested in accordance with ASTM F2324. 

B. Shall use dishwashers that comply with the requirements of the ENERGY 
STAR Program for Commercial Dishwashers. 

Page 4 



C. Shall use boiler-less/connectionless food steamers that consume no more 
than 2.0 gal/h (7.5 L/h) in the full operational mode. 

D. Shall use combination ovens that consume not more than 1 O gal/h (38 L/h) in 
full operational mode. 

E. Shall use air-cooled ice machines that comply with the requirements of the 
ENERGY STAR Program for Commercial Ice Machines. 

F. Shall be equipped with hands-free faucet controllers (foot controllers, sensor 
activated, or other) for all faucet fittings within the food preparation area of the 
kitchen and the dish room, including pot sinks and washing sinks. 

C404.11.4 Medical and Laboratory Facilities. Medical and laboratory facilities, 
including clinics, hospitals, medical centers, physician and dental offices, and medical 
and nonmedical laboratories of all types shall comply with the following: 

A. Use only water-efficient steam sterilizers equipped with: 
1. Water-tempering devices that allow water to flow only when the 
discharge of condensate or hot water from the sterilizer exceeds 140°F 
(60°C). 
2. Mechanical vacuum equipment in place of venture-type vacuum 
systems for vacuum sterilizers. 

B. Use film processor water-recycling units where large-frame X-ray films of 
more than 6 inches (150 mm) in either length or width are processed. 

Exception: Small dental X-ray equipment is exempt from this requirement. 

C. Use digital imaging and radiography systems where the digital networks are 
installed. 

D. Use a dry-hood scrubber system or, if the applicant determines that a wet
hood scrubber is required, the scrubber shall be equipped with a water 
recirculation system. For perchlorate hoods and other applications where a hood 
wash-down system is required, the hood shall be equipped with self-closing 
valves on those wash down systems. 

E. Use only dry vacuum pumps unless fire and safety codes (International Fire 
Code) for explosive, corrosive, or oxidative gases require a liquid ring pump. 

F. Use only efficient water treatment systems that comply with the following 
criteria: 

1. For all filtration processes, pressure gauges shall determine and 
display when to backwash or change cartridges. 

2. For all ion exchange and softening professes, recharge cycles shall 
be set by volume of water treated or based on conductivity or 
hardness. 
3. For reverse osmosis and nanofiltration equipment with a capacity 
greater than 27 gal/h (100 L/h), reject water shall not exceed 60% of 
the feed water and shall be used as scrubber feed water or for the other 
beneficial uses on the project site. 
4. Simple distillation is not an acceptable means of water purification. 

G. With regard to food service operations within medical facilities, comply with 
Section 404.11.3. 

6. Section C405 Electrical Power and Lighting Systems is amended by adding a 
Section C405.10 EV Charging for New Construction to read as follows: 

C405.1 O Electric Vehicle (EV) Charging for New Construction. The building shall be 
provided with electric vehicle (EV) charging in accordance with this section and the 
National Electrical Code (NFPA 70). When parking spaces are added or modified 
without an increase in building size, only the new parking spaces are subject to this 
requirement. 

C405.10.1 Group A, B, E, I, M, R, and S-2 Occupancies. Group A, B, E, I, M, R 
occupancies with 3 or more dwelling units and/or sleeping units, and open or enclosed 

Page 5 



parking garages under S-2 occupancy shall be provided with electric vehicle charging in 
accordance with Table C405.10.1. Calculations for the number of spaces shall be 
rounded up to the nearest whole number. All EVSE Installed and EV Capable Spaces 
are to be included in the calculation for the minimum number of vehicle spaces as 
required by the International Building Code. 

TABLE C405.10.1 
EV I 11 d d EV C bl S nsta e an apa e pace Requirements 

Total Number of Parking Minimum Number of EVSE Minimum Number of EV 
Spaces Installed Spaces Capable Spaces 
1-10 
11-15 
16-19 
20-25 
26+ 

1 -
2 3 
2 4 
2 5 
2 20% of total parkinq spaces 

C405.10.2 Identification. Construction documents shall designate all electric vehicle 
capable and electric vehicle supply equipment installed spaces and indicate the 
locations of conduit and termination points serving them. The circuit breakers or circuit 
breaker spaces reserved for the electric vehicle capable spaces and electric vehicle 
supply equipment installed spaces shall be clearly identified in the panel board. 

C405.10.3 Accessible Parking. Where new EVSE Installed Spaces and/or new EV 
Capable Spaces and new accessible parking are both provided, parking facilities shall 
be designed so that at least one accessible parking space shall be EV Capable or EVSE 
Installed. 

7. Section C406.1 Requirements is amended to read as follows: 

C406.1 Requirements. Buildings shall comply with the following: 

1. On-site supply of renewable energy in accordance with Section C406.5. 

2. Provisions of a dedicated outdoor air system for certain HVAC equipment 
in accordance with Section C406.6. 

3. One additional package selected from the following: 

A More efficient HVAC performance in accordance with Section C406.2. 
B. Reduced lighting power in accordance with Section C406.3. 
C. Enhanced lighting controls in accordance with Section C406.4. 
D. High-efficiency service water heating in accordance with Section C406.7. 
E. Enhanced envelop performance in accordance with Section C406.8. 
F. Reduced air infiltration in accordance with Section C406.9. 

Exception: If the total on-site renewable energy installed per Section C406.5 is 
at least 10 percent of the energy used within the building for mechanical and 
service water heating equipment and lighting regulated in Chapter 4, then 
buildings shall not be required to comply with provisions 2 and 3 of Section 
C406.1. 

8. Section C406.5 On-site renewable energy is amended to read as follows: 

C406.5 On-site renewable energy. The total minimum ratings of on-site 
renewable energy systems shall not be less than 3 percent of the energy used 
within the building for building mechanical and service water heating equipment 
and lighting regulated in Chapter 4. 

9. Section C406.6 Dedicated outdoor air system is amended by adding Section 
C406.6.1. 

C406.6.1 Energy Recovery System. Where the supply of air flow rate of a fan system 
exceeds 30 cfm of outside air, the system shall include an energy recovery system. The 
energy recovery system shall be configured to provide a change in the enthalpy of the 
outdoor air supply of not less than 50 percent of the difference between the outdoor air 
and return air enthalpies, at design conditions. Where an air economizer is required, the 
energy recovery system shall include a bypass or controls that permit operation of the 
economizer as required by Section C403.5. 

Page 6 



10. Section R101.1 Title is amended by adding the name "Town of Breckenridge". 

11. Section R101.5 Compliance is amended by adding a new Section R101.5.2 
Sustainable Building Code to read as follows: 

R101.5.2 Sustainable Building Code. All new structures defined as Residential 
Buildings under Chapter 2 of this code shall be designed and comply with the 
Department of Energy's Zero Ready Home National Program. 

Exception: All new residential structures defined per Section R101.5.2 shall register and 
submit to be reviewed and inspected through the Department of Energy's Zero Energy 
Ready Home National Program as a training exercise per the Town of Breckenridge 
Building Department. The training program will be effective July 1st, 2020 through 
December 31st, 2020. Full compliance with the Department of Energy's Zero Energy 
Ready Home National Program shall be effective January 1st, 2021. 

12. Section R202 Definitions is amended by adding the following definitions within the 
alphabetical order of the existing definitions: 

Electric Vehicle (EV). A vehicle registered for on-road use, primarily powered by an 
electric motor that draws current from a rechargeable storage source that is charged by 
being plugged into an electrical current source. 

Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment (EVSE). The electrical conductors and associated 
equipment external to the electric vehicle that provide a connection between the 
premises wiring and the electric vehicle to provide electric vehicle charging. 

Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment (EVSE) Installed Space. A parking space with 
electric vehicle supply equipment capable of supplying a 40-ampere dedicated branch 
circuit rated at 208/240 volt from a building panel board. 

EV Capable Space. A designated parking space which is provided with a listed raceway 
capable of accommodating a 40-ampere minimum 208/240 volt dedicated branch circuit 
for each future EV Ready or EVSE Installed parking space. Raceways shall not be less 
than trade size 1 (nominal 1-inch inside diameter). Raceways shall originate at the main 
service or subpanel and shall terminate into a listed cabinet, box, or, enclosure in close 
proximity to the proposed location of the EV Capable parking spaces. Raceways are 
required to be continuous at enclosed, inaccessible or concealed areas and spaces. 
The service panel and/or subpanel shall provide capacity to install a 40-ampere 
minimum 208/240 volt dedicated branch circuit and space(s) reserved to permit 
installation of a branch circuit overprotection device. 

EV Ready Space. A designated parking space which is provided with minimum one 40-
ampere minimum 208/240 volt dedicated branch circuit for EVSE servicing electric 
vehicles. The circuit shall terminate in a suitable termination point such as a receptacle, 
junction box, or an EVSE, and be located in close proximity to the proposed location of 
the EV Ready parking spaces. 

13. Table R402.1.2 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component is 
amended by adding footnotes j and k to read as follows: 

Footnote j. For alterations, additions, and remodels of 1,500 square feet or 
less in size, R23 blown in bibs are permitted to be installed in walls in lieu of the 
R20+5 for additions and remodels. If utilizing the R23 bibs, the roof/ceiling 
insulation reductions detailed in R402.2.1 and R402.2.2 are not allowed. 

Footnote k. A fenestration U-Factor of 0.32 is permitted for window replacements 
for Climate Zone 7 and 8. 

14. Section R404 Electrical Power and Lighting Systems is amended by adding a new 
Section R404.2, Electric vehicle (EV) charging for new construction to read as follow: 

R404.2 Electric vehicle (EV) charging for new construction. New construction shall 
facilitate future installation and use of Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment (EVSE) in 
accordance with the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70). 

Page 7 



R404.2.1 One and two family dwellings and townhouses. For each dwelling unit, at 
least one EV Ready Space shall be provided. The branch circuit shall be identified as 
"EV Ready" in the service panel or subpanel directory and the termination shall be 
marked as "EV Ready". 

Exceptions: 1. EV Ready Spaces are not required where no parking spaces 
are provided. 

2. This section does not apply to parking spaces used exclusively 
for delivery vehicle purposes. 

R402.2 Multifamily dwellings (3 or more units). EVSE Installed and EV Capable 
Spaces shall be provided in accordance with Table R404.2.2. Where the calculation of 
percent served results in a fractional parking space, it shall be rounded up to the next 
whole number. The service panel or subpanel circuit directory shall identify the space 
reserved to support EV charging, as "EVSE Installed" or "EV Capable". 

TABLE R404.2.2 
EV Ready Space and EV Capable Space Requirements 

Total Number of Parking Minimum Number of EV Minimum Number of EV 
Spaces Ready Spaces Capable Spaces 
1-10 
11-15 
16-19 
20-25 
26+ 

1 -
1 3 
2 4 
2 5 
2 20% of total parkina spaces 

R404.2.3 Identification. Construction documents shall designate all electric vehicle 
capable spaces, electric vehicle ready spaces, and electric vehicle supply equipment 
installed spaces and indicate the locations of conduit and termination points serving 
them. The circuit breakers or circuit breaker spaces reserved for the electric vehicle 
capable spaces, electric vehicle ready spaces, and electric vehicle supply equipment 
installed spaces shall be clearly identified in the panel board. The conduit for the electric 
vehicle capable spaces shall be clearly identified at both the panel board and the 
termination point at the parking space. 

R404.2.4 Accessible Parking. Where new EVSE Installed Spaces and/or new EV 
Ready Spaces and new accessible parking are both provided, parking facilities shall be 
designed so that at least one accessible parking space shall be EV Ready or EVSE 
Installed. 

15. R501.1 Scope is amended by adding Section R501.1.2, Additions and alterations. 

R501.1.2 Additions and alterations. Additions and interior alterations to an existing 
building where the total valuation is $50,000 or greater, an energy audit shall be 
provided for the existing structure prior to permit issuance. The energy audit 
recommendations and/or conclusions shall not affect the scope of work submitted for the 
permit. 

Exceptions: Re-roofs, exterior siding repair or replacement, and deck additions, 
repairs, or alterations shall not require an energy audit to be conducted. 

Section 3. Except as specifically amended hereby, the Breckenridge Town Code, and 
the various secondary codes adopted by reference therein, shall continue in full force and effect. 

Section 4. The Town Council finds, determines, and declares that this ordinance is 
necessary and proper to provide for the safety, preserve the health, promote the prosperity, and 
improve the order, comfort and convenience of the Town of Breckenridge and the inhabitants 
thereof. 

Section 5. The Town Council finds, determines and declares that it has the power to 
adopt this ordinance pursuant to: (i) Section 31-15-601, C.R.S.; (ii) Section 5.13 of the 
Breckenridge Town Charter; and (iii) the powers granted to home rule municipalities by Article 
XX of the Colorado Constitution. 

Section 6. This ordinance shall be published as provided by Section 5.9 of the 
Breckenridge Town Charter, and shall become effective July 1, 2020. 

Page 8 



-

INTRODUCED, READ ON FIRST READING, APPROVED AND ORDERED 
PUBLISHED IN FULL this 25th day of February, 2020. 

This ordinance was published in full on the Town of Breckenridge website on February 27, 
February 28, February 29, March 1 and March 2, 2020. 

A public hearing on this ordinance was held on April 28, 2020. 

READ, ADOPTED ON SECOND READING AND ORDERED PUBLISHED IN FULL ON THE 
TOWN'S WEBSITE this 28th day of April, 2020. A copy of this Ordinance is available for 
inspection in the office of the Town Clerk. 

ATTEST: 

ospolich, CMC, Town Clerk 

APPROVED IN FORM 

Date 

TOWN OF BRECKENRIDGE 

This Ordinance was published on the Town of Breckenridge website on April 30, May 1, 
May 2, May 3 and May 4, 2020. This ordinance shall become effective on June 3, 2020. 

Page 9 


